6826 OF

Bid Opening:
2:00pm
October 23, 2023

Model Year 2024
General Motors Gregg Young Sid Dillion Husker Auto
Sedans - SUVs- Cross
Year or Current
Make Model Production Body style Drive Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine
Year
C19 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Special Service 2024 Truck 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine
C19A Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Special Service 2024 Truck 2WD $ 41,353.00 40,737.00 $ 41,288.00
C19B Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Special Service 2024 Truck 4WD | $ 43,478.00 $ 42,863.00 $ 43,497.00
C20 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Police Pursuit 2024 Truck 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine
C20A Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Police Pursuit 2024 Truck 4WD | $ 47,214.00 $ 46,597.00 $ 47,199.00
c21 Chevrolet Tahoe Special Service 2024 Suv 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine
C21A Chevrolet Tahoe Special Service 2024 SUV 4WD | $ 47,330.00 $ 47,048.00 48,977.00
Cc22 Chevrolet Tahoe Police Pursuit 2024 Suv 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine 49,499.00
C22A Chevrolet Tahoe Police Pursuit 2024 Suv 2WD 45,223.00 45,205.00 46,799.00
C22B Chevrolet Tahoe Police Pursuit 2024 SUV 4WD 47,971.00 47,659.00 $ 49,499.00
C23 Chevrolet Express Transport Van 2024 VAN 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L gas V8 engine 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L gas V8 engine 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L gas V8 engine
C23A Chevrolet Express Transport Van 2500 2024 Regular 1LS RWD 39,104.00 40,999.00 38,813.00 40,481.00 39,396.00 41,064.00
C23B Chevrolet Express Transport Van 2500 2024 Regular 1LT RWD 40,952.00 42,847.00 40,633.00 42,301.00 41,244.00 42,912.00
Cc23C Chevrolet Express Transport Van 3500 2024 Regular 1LS RWD 39,788.00 41,683.00 39,533.00 41,201.00 40,081.00 41,749.00
C23D Chevrolet Express Transport Van 3500 2024 Regular 1LT RWD 41,285.00 43,180.00 40,993.00 42,661.00 41,577.00 43,245.00
C23E Chevrolet Express Transport Van 3500 2024 Extended 1LS | RWD 40,912.00 42,807.00 40,630.00 42,298.00 40,804.00 42,472.00
C23F Chevrolet Express Transport Van 3500 2024 Extended 1LT| RWD |§ 42,408.00 | § 44,303.00 $ 42,133.00 | $ 43,801.00 $ 42,300.00 | § 43,968.00
Electric Vehicle

C24 Chevrolet Blazer EV Police Pursuit 2024 Suv 20-amp relay 30-amp/ 40-amp relay 20-amp relay 30-amp/ 40-amp relay 20-amp relay 30-amp/ 40-amp relay
C24A Chevrolet Blazer EV Police Pursuit Vehicle 2024 SUV. $ 58,975.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C25 Chevrolet Bolt EV Special Service 2024 Suv 65-kWh 65-kWh 65-kWh
C25A Chevrolet Bolt EV Special Service 2024 SUV No Bid No Bid No Bid
C26 Chevrolet Bolt EUV Special Service 2024 Suv 65-kWh lithium-ion 65-kWh lithium-ion 65-kWh lithium-ion
C26A Chevrolet Bolt EUV Special Service 2024 SUV No Bid No Bid No Bid

Totals: $ 772,837.00 $ 765,587.00 $ 827,570.00

Totals calculated using vehicles that all vendors bid on.
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